ORDINANCE NO. _07-17

AN ORDINANCE ESTABLISHING A BUILDING CODE FOR
THE CITY OF HAYWARD; REGULATING THE
CONSTRUCTION, ALTERATION, REPAIR, AND
MAINTENANCE OF STRUCTURES; PROVIDING FOR THE
ISSUANCE OF PERMITS AND COLLECTION OF FEES;
AND REPEALING ORDINANCE NO, 02-12 AND ALL
AMENDMENTS THERETO

THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF HAYWARD DOES ORDAIN AS
FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Effective January 1, 2008, Ordinance No. 02-12, and all
amendments thereto, is hereby repealed and in substitution thereof a new Building Code for
the City of Hayward is hereby enacted to read as follows:

BUILDING CODE
OF THE CITY OF HAYWARD

: SECTION. 1.00 2007 CALIFORNIA BUIT.DING CODE, ADOPTION BY
REFERENCE. The 2007 California Building Code, based on the 2006 International Building
Code, including volumes 1, 2, & 3, and Appendix thereto, published by the International
Code Conference, as amended by the State of California pursuant to Health and Saféty Code
section 17922, and as further modified by the amendments, additions, and deletions as set
forth hereinafter, is hereby adopted by reference as the Building Code of the City of Hayward.

A printed copy of such 2007 California Building Code which is in three
volumes, together with the State and local amendments thereto, is on file in the office of the
City Clerk, to which reference is hereby made for further particulars.

Reference is also made to the States’ Matrix Adoption Tables which identify
local Building Official’s responsibility to enforce certain amendments.

SECTION 2.00 Applicability of CBC Appendix Chapters. Wherever in the
CBC reference is made to an appendix chapter, the provisions of the said appendix shall not

apply unless specifically adopted by this code. The following table is provided for reference:



Appendix Subject Applicability
Chapter _ 3
1 Administration Adopted & Amended the
Administrative Code Applicable to all
Adopted Codes
A Employee Qualifications Not Applicable
B Board of Appeals Not Applicable
C Group U Agricultural Buildings | Not Applicable
D Fire Districts Not Applicable
E Reserved Not Applicable
'F Rodent Proofing Not Applicable
G Flood Resistant Construction Not Applicable
H Signs Not Applicable
I Patio Covers Applicable
J Grading Not Applicable

APPENDIX CHAPTER 1
ADMINISTRATIVE

SECTION 101 GENERAL.

Appendix Chapter 1, “Administration”, is hereby adopted as the administrative
chapter for the building codes for the City of Hayward with amendments as follows:

SECTION 101 TITLE.
Section 101.1 is revised to read as follows:

101.1 Title. The CBC, as amended herein, shall be known as the “Building
Code of the City of Hayward.” The provisions contained herein are adopted, and together
with the amended CBC, are referred to hereafter as “these regulations” or “these building
standards” or “this code.” '

SECTION 101.4.5 PROPERTY MAINTENANCE.
The first sentence of Section 101.4.5 is revised to read as follows:

101.4.5 Property maintenance. The provisions of the International Code for
Property Maintenance shall apply to existing structures and premises; equipment and
facilities; light, ventilation, space heating, sanitation, life and fire safety hazards;
responsibilities of owners, operators and occupants; and occupancy of existing premises and
structures.

Page 2 of Ordinance No. 07-17



SECTION 102.4.1 ABSENCE OF REFERENCED STANDARDS.
A new section, 102.4.1 is added to read as follows:

102.4.1 Absence of referenced codes or standards. Where, in any specific
case, applicable code sections are absent due to the fact they have not been adopted by the
State of California, the building official may require or allow use of alternative codes as a
reference document. These codes may include but are not limited to the 2006 International
Residential Code, 2006 International Plumbing Code, 2006 International Mechanical Code,
2006 International Electric Code. The use of alternative referenced code will be at the sole
discretion of the building official. ' '

SECTION 103.1 CREATION OF ENFORCEMENT AGENCY.

Section 103.1 is revised 1o read as follows:

103.1 Creation of Enforcement Agency. The Building Division of the
Community and Economic Development Department is hereby created and the official in
charge thereof shall be known as the building official. ‘

SECTION 104.11.3 PEER REVIEW.

Section 104.11.3 Peer Review is hereby deleted.

SECTION 105.1.1 ANNUAL PERMITS.

Section 105.1.1 Annual Permits is hereby deleted.
SECTION 105.1.2. ANNUAL PERMIT RECORDS.
Section 105.1.2 Annual Permit Records is hereby deleted.
SECTION 105.2 WORK EXEMPT FROM PERMITS.

Section 105.2 Work Exempt From Permit Number 6 is amended to read as
follows:

6. Sidewalks, driveways and decks not more than 30 inches above grade,
and not over any basement or story below and are not part of an accessible route.

SECTION 105.5 EXPIRATION.

Section 105.5 is hereby deleted and new section 105.5 is added as follows:

Page 3 of Ordinance No. 07-17



105.5 Expiration, With the following exceptions, every permit issued by the
building official under the provisions of this code shall expire by limitation and become null
and void if the building or work authorized by such permit is not completed within 1 year
from the date of issuance: : ‘

1. The building official shall have the authority to authorize longer time periods
for specific projects.

2, Whenever a permit is issued specifically to correct a violation of this code or of
- any-pertinent law, rule, regulation, or ordinance, or to rehabilitate, repair, modify, remove, or
demolish a dangerous or illegal building or structure or equipment, or to otherwise abate a
nuisance, the building official shall establish a reasonable time period for the completion of the
work. :

3. Whenever a permit is issued for certain short-term projects, the building official
shall have the authority to establish a time period of less than 1 year. These projects may
include, but not be limited to, termite repairs, free-standing fireplace stoves, solar system
installations, spas and hot tubs, demolition, and electrical service alterations.

4. The permit holder may renew a permit for a period of no longer than 1 year

after the original date of expiration, provided that the request for renewal is submitted (o the

- building official prior to the said expiration date along with the payment of a renewal fee, that
no changes have been made or will be made in the original plans and specifications, and that

- no laws, regulations, rules, or ordinances have been changed in such as manner as to prohibit
- the completion of the proposed work. This renewed permit shall require that all incomplete .
work conform to the laws, regulations, rules, and ordinances in effect at the time of renewal
The permit renewal fee shall be established as indicated in Sections 108.

SECTION 105.5.1 COMPLETION PERMITS.
New Section 105.5.1 is added as follows:

105.5.1 Completion permits. In the event that an initial or a renewed permit
expires before the work is complete, the completion of the work shall require the issuance of a
“completion” permit and the payment of an additional permit fee; moreover, the building
official shall have the authority to require the resubmittal of plans, a new plan review, and/or
the updating or reassessment of the valuation of the incomplete work. This completion permit
will require that all incomplete work conform to the laws, regulations, rules, and ordinances in
effect at the time of issuance and that all work be completed prior to the expiration date; no
further extensions or renewals shall be allowed. The completion permit fee shall be
established as indicated in Section 108.7 and in accordance with the schedule of previously
completed and inspected work.

Page 4 of Ordinance No. 07-17



Notwithstanding the above, in the event that a permittee fails to complete the -
work and to obtain a completion permit within 1 year following the expiration of an initial or a
renewal permit, the work may not be completed pending the issuance of a new permit.. The
building official shall have the authority to require the resubmittal of some or all of the plans
and specifications, a partial or complete plan review, the payment of additional review and
filing fees, and that all work conform to the laws, regulations, rules, and ordinances in effect
at the time of the latest permit application.

SECTION 106.1 SUBMITTAL DOCUMENTS.
Paragraph 1 of Sectiqh 106.1"is revised to read as follows:

106.1 Submittal documents. Plans, topographic plats, specifications,
engineering calculations, stress diagrams, heat loss calculations demonstrating compliance with
California Energy Conservation Standards, soil 1nvest1gat10n reports, geotechnical
investigation reports, test data, flood elevation certifications, flood design certifications,
electrical load calculations, gas and water supply demand calculatio'ns, sewer service
documentation, air quality releases, and other data sufficient to show the correctness of the
plans and specifications and to assure that the proposed building or work will conform to the
requirements of this code and to all other applicable laws, rules, regulations, and ordinances,

- shall be submitted when and in the quantity required by the building official.

SECTION 106.1.1 SUBMITTAL DOCUMENTS.

Section 106.1.1 is hereby deleted and replaced by new Section 106.1.1 as
follows:

106.1.1 Information on construction documents. Plans and specifications shall
be drawn to scale upon substantial and adequately sized paper using a semi-permanent medium
and shall be of sufficient clarity to indicate the location, nature, and extent of the work
proposed and show in detail that it will conform to the provisions of this code and all relevant
laws, rules, regulations, and ordinances. The building official shall have the authority to
reject plans and specifications that are drawn using pencil or other readily changeable medium
or that are drawn on unsuitable or improperly sized paper.

The first sheet of each set of plans shall contain the address or legal description
of the property where the work is proposed to be done, the name and address of the owner of
the property and the name, and the address and signature of the person who has prepared the
plans.

The plans shall include a plot plan that shall show the location of existing
buildings and structures, any proposed additions or modifications thereto, and all proposed
buildings or structures. The plan shall also show any designated flood, earthquake, or seismic
hazard zones on or adjacent to the premises along with topographic features and accessory

Page 5 of Ordinance No. 07-17



structures such as waterways, slopes, driveways, retaining walls, fences, poles, wells etc.,
and any affected underground structures, lines, pipes, and conduits. oo

If the permit apphcatmn is for a new building or structure, a moved building, or
a substantially improved building in a ﬂoodplam the applicant shall submit the plotplan in the
form of a topographic plat prepared and signed by a licensed land surveyor, or a registered
* civil engineer qualified under the provisions of the State Business and Professions Code to
prepare such a document. The plat shall be drawn to scale and shall show contours at
intervals of 1 foot (.3 m) or less on slopes up to 3% and not more than 5 feet (1.5 m) on
slopes more than 3%. The plat shall show the location under or above ground, of all existing
or proposed gas mains and scrvices; water mains, water services, fire hydrants, sewer mains;
power and communication lines; poles and-transformers; storm drains, inlets, culverts, curbs,
gutters, sidewalks, pavement, building and private sewers, wells, septic tanks and leach fields.
The plat shall also delincate all easements and special building setback lines established by
covenants or restrictions on the property, all watercourse setback, floodplain, earthquake fault,
and seismic hazard boundaries designated by the county, and the width, alignment, grade, and
surface treatment of all driveways or access roadways that will be used by emergency services
personnel. The building official may require that the plat include the plotting of a boundary
line survey whenever the exact location of the line is necessary for the enforcement of any of
the provisions of this code. If a question as to the location of a property line or any other
boundary line arises at any time before or afier the issuance of a permit, the building official
- shall have the authority to require that a survey of the line be performed, the line be located by
- appropriate stakes or monuments, and that 3 copies of a plat of the survey be filed with the
building official.

EXCEPTIONS:

1. A topographic plat is not required for any lot shown on a subdivision tract map, if
the said map was filed at the county recorder’s office within 5 years of the date of the
application for a permit.

2. The building official may upon written request waive the requirements for a
topographic plat map under any one of the following conditions:

a. Properties that contain substantial existing development; or

b. Properties where a topographic plat map has been previously submitted
to the building official and where there have been no significant changes
to the finished grades shown on the said map; or

c. Properties where the building official determines that the information
that would be provided by a plat completed in accordance with this
Section is not necessary to show that the work proposed by a particular
permit application can be completed in compliance with this code.

Page 6 of Ordinance No. 07-17



- The plans shall also-include a grading and drainage plan showing existing
elevations or contours and all proposed final elevations within 100 feet of any proposed
buildings or structures, including the adjacent grade at the buildings or structures. This plan
shall also show how all portions of the lot are to be drained, all necessary drainage structures,
and the contours or a profile of any proposed access roadways. The grading and drainage plan
may be coimbined with the plot plan if such information can be clearly shown on the plot plan.

Plans for buildings other than group R - division 3 and group U occupancies,
as defined in the 2007 CBC, shall indicate how required structural and fire-resistive integrity
will be maintained where a penetration will be made for electrical, mechanical, plumbing and
commumcatlon conduits, pipes, and similar systems. :

The building official shall have the authority to waive the requirements for a
plot plan and a grading plan if the proposed work is minor, and does not involve the
~ construction of new buildings or structures or the change in configuration of ex1stmg buildings
or structures

SECTION 106.3 EXAMINATION OF DOCUMENTS.

: A second paragraph is added to Section 106.3 Examination of Documents, to
read as follows:

106.3 Exammatlon of Documents The apphcatlon plans, specifications,
_computatlons certifications, and other data filed by an applicant for a permit shall be reviewed -
by the building official. Such plans may also be reviewed by other departments of the: City of
Hayward as required by the applicable laws, rules, regulations, and ordinances, including but
not limited to the review required by Section 13146 of the state Health and Safety Code of
those occupancies regulated by the State Fire Marshal. If the building official finds that the
work described in the application for a permit and-the plans, specifications; computations,
certifications and other data filed therewith conform to the requirements of this code and other
pertinent laws, rules, regulations, and ordinances, and that the fees specified by the City of
Hayward’s master fee schedule as shall be amended from time to time, have been paid, the
building official shall issue a building permit to the applicant.

SECTION 106.3.2 PERMIT ISSUANCE.

Section 106.3.2 Previous approvals is hereby deleted and a new Section
106.3.2, is added as follows:

106.3.2 Permit issuance. The building official may issue the permit to a
property owner acting as an owner-builder in compliance with Chapter 9 of Part 3 of Division
13 of the Health and Safety Code of the state or to a contractor acting in compliance with
Chapter 9 of Division 3 of the Business and Professions Code of the state. It shall be the
responsibility of the permit holder to assure that all work authorized by the permit is done in
accordance with this code and all other pertinent laws, rules, regulations, and ordinances, and

Page 7 of Ordinance No. 07-17



. to call for and make arrangements for the required inspections of the work. If, after such-
inspections by the building official, correction of completed work is deemed necessary, the
permit - holder shall be responsible for these corrections. If a contractor holding a‘permit is
unable or.unwilling to perform the necessary corréctions, the property owner: shall be
_respons1ble for the completion of the sald corrections. S

The issuance of a permit upon the submittal and approval of plans and
specifications shall not prevent the Administrative Authority from thereafter requiring the
correction of errors in the said plans and specifications, or from preventing construction -
operations being carried on thereafter when in violation of this code or any other pertinent
county ordinance, or from revoking any certificate of approval issued in error. - :

An issued building permit may not be transferred to any other person w1thout
the approval of the building official. :

' SECTION 106.6 EXPIRATION OF PLAN REVIEW.
New Section 106.6 is added as follows: -

106.6 Expiration of Plan Review. Applications for which no permit is issued
within 1 year following the date of completion of the initial review of the submitted plans, or
applications for which no permit is issued within 18 months following the date of application,
shall éxpire by limitation. The building official may extend either of these expiration dates for
an additional period, not exceeding 180 days, upon written request by the'applicant showing
that circumstances beyond the control of the appllcant have prevented actlon from being taken.
No appllcatlon shall be extended more than once. :

Following final explratlon of the application, plans and other data submitted for
review may thereafter be returned to the applicant or destroyed by the building official.
In order to renew action on an application after expiration, the applicant shall resubmit plans
and pay a new plan review fee.

SECTION 106.5 MAINTENANCE OF BUILDING PLANS.

Section 106.5 Retention of construction documents is hereby deleted and is
replaced with a new section 106.5 as follows:

106.5 Maintenance of building plans. The building department of Hayward
shall maintain an official copy, which may be on microfilm or other type of photographic
copy, of the plans of every building, during the life of the building, for which the department
issued a building permit. "Building department" means the department, bureau, or officer
charged with the enforcement of laws or ordinances regulating the erection, construction, or
alteration of buildings. Except for plans of a common interest development as defined in
Section 1351 of the Civil Code, plans need not be filed for:

Page 8 of Ordinance No. 07-17



{(a) Single or multiple dwellings not more than two stories and basement in height.

(b) Garages and other structures appurtenant-to bulldmgs descrlbed under subd1v131on
(c) Farm or ranch buildings. :
. (d) Any one-story bulldmg where the span between bearing walls does not exceed 25
feet.
The exemption in this subd1v131on does not, however, apply toa steel frame or
. concrete building. :

SECTION 108.1 PAYMENT OF FEES.
Section 108.1 is revised to read as follows:

108.1 Payment of fees. Prior to the issuance of any permit required by this
code, the applicant shall pay the pertinent permit fee as assessed by the building official in
accordance with the schedule described in Section 108.2 along with all other appropriate fees -
required by this code and by the Municipal Code of the City of Hayward. The said fee shall
cover both the administrative costs of preparing and issuing the permit and the normal
inspection requirements as described in 109; however, when an inspection requires
corrections and the said corrections require more than one reinspection, or when:an inspection
is called for by the permittee but the work is not ready for the inspection; or where:the plans,
specifications, or other material required for the inspection is not available to the inspector,
the building official may require that a reinspection fee be paid to the bulldlng ofﬁc1a1 prior to
the required reinspection, ' :

The fees for reinspections and for other inspections, including but not limited to
the inspection of existing buildings or structures being prepared for movement into or out of
the county, shall be set by the building official in accordance with the schedule described in
Section 108.

SECTION 108.1.1 PLAN REVIEW FEES.
New Section 108.1.1 is added as follows:

108.1.1 Plan Review Fees. When submittal documents are required by Section
106.1, a plan review fee shall be paid at the time of submitting the said documents for review.
Said plan review fee shall be assessed by the building official in accordance with the schedule
described in Section 108.2.

The plan review fee specified in this Section is separate from and in addition to
the permit fee specified in Section 108.2. This review fee shall cover both the initial review of
the submitted plans and a single re-check of the corrected plans. Any further re-checking shall
be subject to the additional plan checking fee established in the fee schedule described in
Section 108.2; moreover, when submittal documents are incomplete or changed so as to

Page 9 of Ordinance No. 07-17



require additional plan review, or when the project involves deferred submittal items, the
. -additional plan review fee shall be charged as specified in the said fee schedule.:

SECTION 108.2 SCHEDULE OF PERMIT FEES,

Section 108.2 is revised to read as follows:

108.2 Schedule of permit fees. Fees shall be as set forth in a fee schedule
adopted, for this purpose, by resolution of the City Council. The said schedule shall establish,
but not be limited to, fees for permit issuance and inspections, filing of certain permit
exemptions, regular plan reviews, Title 24 energy conservation reviews, termite report
reviews, special or additional plan checking, off-hour inspections, re-inspections, movement of -
buildings or structures, demolition of burldmgs or structures, permit renewals completlon
' permlts -and permit re-issuance.

- The fees for the plan checking and permit issnance of related items shall also
be included in the said fee schedule,

SECTION 108.6 FEE REFUNDS.

Section 108.6 is revised to read as follows:

- 108.6 Fee Refunds. The building official shall not authorize refunding of any
fee paid to the building official except on written application filed by the original permittee,

The building official may authorize refunding of any fee pald under this code
that was: erroneously paid or collected.

The building official may authorize the refunding of a maximum of 60% of the
initial permit fee paid to the building official when no work has been done under an-unexpired
permit issued in accordance with this code. If no work has been done and an issued permit
has expired, the building official may authorize refunding of not more than 30% of the said
permit fee, provided that the request for refund is submitted within 1 year following the permit
expiration; after 1 year beyond the permit expiration date, no refund of the permit fee shall be
authorized.

The building official may authorize the refunding of a maximum of 60% of the
plan review fee paid to the building official if no plan review comments have been issued by
the building official prior to the receipt of the request for refund. No refund of this fee shall
be authorized following the issuance of the initial plan review comments by the building
official.

Page 10 of Ordinance No. 07-17



SECTION 108.7 INVESTIGATION FEES: WORK WITHOUT A PERMIT.

New Section 108.7 is added as follows;

108.7 Investigation Fees: Work without a Permit. Whenever any work for
which a permit is required by this code has been commenced without first obtaining said
permit, the building official shall perform an mvestlgatlon prior to the issuance of the permit
authorizing the work.

An investigation fee shall be charged to offset the cost of the said investigation.

ThlS fee shall be in addition to any other regular plan review or permit fee, and shall be

collected whether or not a permit is then or subsequently issued. The amount of the -

- investigation fee shall be assessed by the building official in accordance with the schedule
described in Section 108.2 and based upon the circumstances and extent of the violation, but in
no case shall be less than the amount of the permit fee required by this code. The payment of

.such investigation fee shall not exempt-any person from compliance with all other:provisions
of this code nor from any penalty prescribed by law.

SECTION 108.8 FEES FOR COMPLETION PERMITS.

New Section 108.8 is added as follows:

108.8 Fees for completion permits. 'Fees for completion permits as described in

. 3ection 105.5.1 shall be based upon the percentage of work that has passed. inspection prior to
the expiration of the renewed permit. If either valuation or fees have changed since the

- original permit was issued the fees or the valuation shall be updated to the new fees or
valuations in effect at the time the completion permit is issued. The percentages to be charged
will remain the same.

This schedule is intended to apply to conventional wood frame building
construction. In the event that the work is not conventional wood frame construction, or does
not constitute a complete building, or is a type of structure other than a building, the building
official shall determine the fee based upon the number of the inspections remaining to be
performed.

Completed Inspections! % of Updated Valuation
None 60
Foundation 55
Under-floor 50
Shear Wall 40
Rough Frame 30
Lath or Gypsum Board 20
Gas Test 15
All, except Final 10

Page 11 of Ordinance No. 07-17



SECTION 108.9 REINSPECTION FEES.
Section 108.9 is added as follows:

108.9 Reinspections. If reinspections are required, fees for the same may be
assessed in accordance with Section 108. To obtain a re-inspection, the permittee ‘shall file an
application therefore in writing on a form furnished for that purpose, by the building official,
and pay any assessed re-inspection fee. In those instances where the building official has
assessed a re-inspection fee, the - building inspector shall perform no addltlonal 1nspect10ns of
the work until the required fee has been paid. ,

SECTION 109.3.12 INSPECITONS OF MOVED BUILDINGS.
Section 109.3.12 is added as follows: .

Inspections of moved buildings. Prior to the issuance of a permit to move any
building or structure or equipment into, within, or out of the unincorporated areas of the
county, the building official shall inspect the same to assure compliance with'this code and
with all pertinent laws, rules, regulations, and ordinances, including but not limited to the
capability of the building or structure or equipment to be moved without endangering the
public safety. The building official may require that portions of the building or structure or
equipment be removed or uncovered in order to determine such compliance. :If after
inspection, the building official determines that the building or structure or equipment cannot
‘be safely moved or cannot reasonably be altered, modified, or improved to meet any other
.requirement of this code or of the pertinent laws, rules, regulations, and ordinances, he/she
shall have the authority to deny the application for a permit. In the event of such-denial, the
building official shall notify the applicant, in writing, stating the reasons for such denial.

In the event that the building or structure or equipment is proposed to be
removed from the unincorporated county into another jurisdiction, the building official shall
coordinate all permit issuances or denials with that jurisdiction.

SECTION 109.4 SPECIAL INSPECTIONS.
Section 109.4 is deleted and new section 109.4 is added as follows:

109.4 Special Inspections. When this code requires tests, inspections, or
observations per Chapter 17 of the CBC, the architect or engineer of record shall submit, upon
a special form provided by the building official, an inspection program that must be approved
by the building official prior to the issuance of the building permit. This program shall
include the description of all work requiring special tests and inspections, the nature of the
tests and inspections, the names and qualifications of the designated testing and inspecting
persons, the specific duties of the special inspectors, samples of the required inspection
reports, and time limits for the submittal of the reports.

Page 12 of Ordinance No. 07-17



