CITYOF’ 6
HAYWARD

HEART OF THE BAY

DATE: November 6, 2007

TO: Mayor and City Council

FROM: Director of Community and Economic Development
Hayward Fire Chief

SUBJECT: Introduction of Ordinances to Adopt the 2007 California Fire Code, 2007 California
Building Code (CBC), the 2007 California Electrical Code, the 2007 California
Mechanical Code, the 2007 California Plumbing Code, the 2006 International Code
Jor Property Maintenance, 2007 California Existing Building Code, and the 2007
California Historical Building Code

RECOMMENDATION

That the Council adopts the attached resolutions of findings and introduces the attached ordinances
adopting the 2007 California Fire Code, 2007 California Building Code (CBC), the 2007 California
Electrical Code, the 2007 California Mechanical Code, the 2007 California Plumbing Code, the
2006 International Code for Property Maintenance, 2007 California Existing Building Code, and
the 2007 California Historical Building Code.

SUMMARY

This is the first reading of the ordinances adopting the new codes and the local amendments thereto
and the resolutions for the findings of fact to support the need for the local amendments. The final
reading and adoption of the ordinance is scheduled for November 20. The new codes become
effective on January 1, 2008 as per California State law.

BACKGROUND

In the past, the State of California tri-annually reviewed and amended the model Uniform Codes.
The amended codes were then published by the Building Standards Commission and local
jurisdictions were mandated to enforce most of the provisions of these codes. The last Uniform
Building Code was published in 1997. Subsequently, the International Council of Building
Officials, the code-writing body for the Uniform Building Code, merged with the other model code
organizations in the United States in order to publish a single set of codes. These are known as the
“International Codes™ and have been adopted by most states in the United States as well as by a
number of foreign countries.



In California there has been some controversy over which codes would be adopted by the State so
new codes have not been adopted since 2001. The Building Standards Commission finally decided
to adopt and amend the 2006 International Building Code and the 2006 Iniernational Fire Code but
to keep and amend the 2006 Uniform Plumbing and Mechanical Codes published by the
International Association of Plumbing and Mcchanical Officials IAPMO). The new, 2007
California Electrical Code is based on the 2005 National Electrical Code. In July the Building
Standards Commission published the California codes and local jurisdictions are mandated to begin
enforcement six months after the publication date. During this period local jurisdictions are allowed
to make amendments to the California codes.

Such amendments can only make the codes more restrictive than the published codes and must be
based on express findings that such modifications or changes are necessary because of local
climatic, geological, or topographicat conditions. This action is exempt from CEQA review
pursuant to Section 15378 (b)(1) State legislation of the CEQA Guidelines.

DISCUSSION

Staff is suggesting only a minimum of local amendments to the new codes. All such amendments,
except for administrative items, must be to make the code more restrictive than the published codes.
Amendments can be made only for local climatic, topographical or geological reasons. The
amendments and the findings of fact which make such amendments necessary must be submitted to
the Building Standards Commission before they can hbecome effective. The following sections
summarize the proposed City amendments.

Fire Code: The 2007 California Fire Code is based on the 2006 International Fire Code. The City
of Hayward Fire Department is recommending that the City Council approves the code with local
amendments the Fire Chief has put forward to maintain the same level of life safety that cxistcd
with the previously adopted codes and local amendments. Two examples of local amendments
that have been recommended are: 1. Prohibiting hazardous materials and flammable liquids in
basements; 2. Requiring any automatic sprinkler system be installed throughout the entire
building and not allowing partial sprinkler systems.

Building Code Changes: Changes to the building code are either for administrative requirements
which do not have to be justified by findings to the Building Standards Commission or they are for
increased seismic standards. The seismic changes have been suggested by the Structural Engineers
and reviewed by a committee of engineers from the three Bay Area chapters (East Bay, Peninsula,
Napa-Solano) of the Intetnational Code Council. The major administrative change is to put a
definite limit on the time a building permit is valid. Currently a permit may stay open indefinitcly if
some work done is on the project every six months. Once the change goes into effect a permit
expires after one year whether the work is completed or not. It may be renewed once but, if the
work is still not completed, new fees must be paid based on the amount of work remaining,

Electrical Code Changes: Local amendments are necessary to provide additional safety features due
to the probability of seismic activity in this area. The changes are to provide additional support for
wiring as well as better identification of multi-wire branch circuits.

Ordinance New California Fire, Building, and Related Codes 2of4
Report Date; November 6, 2007



Mechanical Code Changes: The amendments to the Mechanical Code are administrative in nature.

Plumbing Code Changes: Staff proposes that the City adopt the California Plumbing Code as
adopted by the State. This limits the use of plastic drain, waste, and vent systems (DWV) to one or
two story residential construction. Staff'is also proposing to allow plastic pipe for potable water
within residential buildings.

Plastic piping material for small buildings and residential use is commonly used in the majority of
other cities within the Bay Area. It is a safe and economical material. In the past, Council has
chosen to disallow any plastic piping materials in interiors of residential buildings citing the
potential for toxic gases in case of fire. Since plastic pipes are usually installed in the walls, and
therefore, protected by sheetrock, the potential for their adding to the fire loading is minimal. Ina
building the furniture and other contents of the building create a higher fire danger than plastic pipe.
Most of the structures where plastic piping is allowed by State code are one or two story dwellings
or small commercial buildings. The use of cast iron piping in these occupancies imposes additional
costs on small contractors and home owners.

Other Adopted Codes: There are no changes to the other adopted codes. These are adopted to be
used as reference materials or where items in these codes are not addressed by the other codes.

FISCAL IMPACT:

The fiscal impact to the City of Hayward has been $10,000 for the new code books for the staff.
There is also the cost of putting our local amendments on the City of Hayward’s web site. This
should not cost more than $2000. There will also be a fiscal benefit to the City of Hayward from
the proposed limitation on the time a building permit is valid. After two years the City will be able
lo impose new fees to recover the cost of providing inspections.

PUBLIC CONTACT:

Tonight’s meeting constitutes a public hearing on the adoption of these codes. A notice of this
hearing was published in the Hayward Daily Review on October 27, 2007. Handouts about the
adoption of the new codes have been in the Permit Center for over a month. The Building Industry
Association, the Building Construction Trades Council, the Central Labor Council of Alameda
County, and the Chamber of Commerce have been notified of the hearing.

SCHEDULE

A final reading of the ordinance will be presented to Council at the meeting of November 27, 2007.
The ordinance goes into effect on January 1, 2008.

Ordinance New California Five, Building, and Related Codes 3of4
Report Date: November 6, 2007



=z

m(ﬂ& F (oﬁi\f

Margret El tt, Building Official

John Berg, Hayward Fir@al

Recommended by:

Ao &M&W

Susan J. Daludd 1 , Ph.D.
Director of Communlty and Economic elopment

Larry Arfsten, I7(yward Fire Lhi

Approved by:

//%o/ry ~Jones, City Manager

Attachments: Draft Ordinances (6}
Draft Resolutions (5)

Ordinance New California Fire, Building, and Related Codes
Heport Date: November 6, 2007

dof 4



DRAFT

HAYWARD CITY COUNCIL o
\0\?
RESOLUTION NO. __

- Introduced by Council Member

RESOLUTION FINDING AND DETERMINING THE NEED
FOR CHANGES OR MODIFICATION TO THE CALIFORNIA
FIRE CODE, 2007 EDITION

WHEREAS, California Health and Safety Code sections 13143.2 and 13143.5
perniit a city to make such changes or modifications as deemed reasonably necessary because
of local conditions to be made in specified uniform industry codes; and

WHEREAS, it is necessary that the City's Fire Code be revised to conform
with parallel provisions in the City's Building Code as well as to address specialized needs
presented by local conditions,

]

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED that the City Council of the City of
Hayward does hereby find and determine as follows:

1. In connection with the adoption by reference of the California Fire Code, 2007
Edition, the City needs to adopt changes or modifications to the following sections of the
California Fire Code, 2007 Edition, by reason of local conditions: 1, 2, 3, 4, 5,6, 7, §,
APPENDIX CHAPTER 1 - 104.1, 104.10.1, 105.2.2, 105.8, 108.1, 202, 503.2.8, 508.5.1,
603.4, 901.4.2, 901.4.5, 903.1.1, 903.1.2, 903.1.3, 903.1.4, 903.1.5, 905.1, 905.3, 905 4,
1413.1, 2703.1.5, 2905.3, 3401.4.1, 3403.1.4, 3404.1.1, 3406.2, 3406.2.8, 4702, 4706,
APPENDIX B SECTION 105, B105.1 and B 105.2, APPENDIX C TABLE C105.1, 9, 10,
11, 12, 13, AND 14.

o 2. The amendments to the California Fire Code, 2007 Edition (published by the
International Code Council) have been recognized by the City of Hayward to address the fire
problems, concerns, and future directions by which this City can establish and maintain an.
environment which will afford an acceptable level of fire and life safety to its citizens and
guests.

3. The "Findings of Facts" contained herein addresses present local conditions
which either singularly or in combination cause the aforesaid amendments to be adopted. The
following local conditions have an adverse effect on the prevention and control of major loss
fires, thereby making it necessary to adopt the above changes or modifications in the
California Fire Code in order to provide a reasonable degree of fire and life safety in this
community. '



@

(b)

©

(@

©)

(@

CLIMATIC

Precipitation: - Precipitation ranges from 15 to 24 inches per year with an
average of approximately 17.58 inches per year. 95 percent falls during the
months of October through April, and five percent from May through
September.

Relative Humidity: Humidity during May through November ranges between
20 to 40 percent going as low as 10 percent on an average of 10 days during
this period. During December through April, the humidity ranges from 41 to
68 percent.

Temperatures: High temperatures have been recorded in the low 100's F.
Average summer highs are in the 73° F. range with an average annual
maximum temperature of 66° F.

Winds: Prevailing winds are from the west, northwest (WNW). However,
winds are experienced from virtually every direction at one time or another.
Velocities are generally in the 14 to 23 miles-per-hour range, gusting to 25 to
35 miles-per-hour.. Forty miles-per-hour winds are experienced occasionally,
and higher have been registered. During the winter half of the year, strong,
dry, gusty winds from the north move through the area for several days,
creating extremely dry conditions. '

Summary: These local climatic conditions effect the acceleration, intensity, and
size of fires in the community. Times of little or no rainfall, of low humidity,
and high temperatures create extremely hazardous conditions, particularly as
they relate to wood shake and shingle roof fires and fires involving buildings.
During wildland and wood shake and shingle roof fires, winds can carry sparks
and burning brands to other roofs, thus spreading the fire and causing
conflagrations. In building fires, winds can literally force fire back into
buildings and can create a blowtorch effect, in addition to preventing "natural”
ventilation and cross-ventilation efforts.

GEOLOGICAL AND TOPOGRAPHIC

Vegetation: Dry grass and brush are common in the hills and open-space areas
adjacent to built-up locations during six to eight months of each year. Many of
these areas frequently experience wildland fires which threaten nearby
buildings, particularly those with wood roofs or sidings.

Page 2 of Resolution No. 07-



(b)

©

(@)

()

®

(2)

Hills. Creeks. Canals, Freeways. Railways, Housing Tracts, Large Buildings.
Building Complexes. and the Airport: All of these surface features, both
natural and man-made, have a major adverse effect upon the road and street
layout in the City including major traffic routes. These conditions limit the
number, and cause indirect routing of major arterial streets for normal traffic as
well as emergency vehicle response.

Terrain: Areas with buildings include level, sloping, and rolling terrain. This
terrain is not dissimilar to terrain in other locations which have experienced
major conflagrations.

Roads and Streets: As noted above, the limited number, and the indirect
routing of roads and streets in the City create heavy, slow traffic conditions and
excessively long travel routes from point to point.

Population: The current and rapidly growing population in the City creates two
fire protection problems;

(1)  The more people, the more emergency incidents requiring Fire
Department response. The greater the frequency of alarms, the greater
the chance there will be simultaneous emergency incidents requiring Fire
Department response. This results in longer response times and/or
fewer fire companies to respond to any emergency within the City; and

2) The more people, the more traffic congestion during a greater part of the
day. Such traffic congestion not only slows Fire Department response
but often restricts access to fire scenes.

Buildings, Landscaping, and Clearances: Many building complexes are of
designs which greatly limit the approach to and accessibility by Fire Department

resources. Many houses and other buildings with wood roofs or sidings are

close together, and fire will readily spread from one to another by both
radiation and convection of flying brands.

Summary: Essentially, the above local geological and topographical conditions
present fire frequency, magnitude, exposures, and accessibility problems and
have a negative impact upon the response capability of the Fire Department.
The quantity of Fire Department resources that can arrive within an effective
time is limited. The time in which they can respond is extended due to lengthy
travel distances and traffic congestion.

Page 3 of Resolution No. 07-



4. = CONCLUSION. Local climatic, geological, and topographic conditions have a
definite impact upon the frequency, spread, acceleration, intensity and size of fire involving
buildings in Hayward. Furthermore, they have an adverse impact upon the number of Fire
Department resources which can be brought to bear upon such fires within an expeditious
period of time. Therefore, it is found to be reasonably necessary that the California Fire Code
be changed or modified to adopt more stringent requirements to mitigate the effects of the
above conditions. '

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that the City Clerk is hereby directed to cause a
copy of this resolution, together with the modifications or changes to the California Fire Code,
to be filed with the State of California Department of Housing and Community Development,
the state Building Standards Commission, and the state Fire Marshal, by registered mail.

BE IT FURTHER RESOLVED that, should any finding contained herein be

declared for any reason invalid, it is the intent of the City Council that it would have passed all
remaining portions of this resolutlon

IN COUNCIL, HAYWARD, CALIFORNIA , 2007

ADOPTED BY THE FOLLOWING VOTE:

AYES: COUNCIL MEMBERS:

MAYOR:
NOES: COUNCIL MEMBERS:

ABSTAIN: COUNCIL MEMBERS:

ABSENT: COUNCIL MEMBERS:

ATTEST:
City Clerk of the City of Hayward

APFROVED AS TO FORM:

City Attorney of the City of Hayward

Page 4 of Resolution No. 07-



ORDINANCE NO. ___ M
AN ORDINANCE ESTABLISHING A FIRE PREVENTION
CODE FOR THE CITY OF HAYWARD; ADOPTING THE
CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE, 2007 EDITION, PRESCRIBING
REGULATIONS GOVERNING CONDITIONS HAZARDOUS
TO LIFE AND PROPERTY FROM FIRE OR EXPLOSION;
PROVIDING FOR THE ISSUANCE OF PERMITS AND
COLLECTION OF FEES; PROVIDING IFOR PENALTIES
FOR VIOLATION; AND REPEALING ORDINANCE NO.
02-13, AS AMENDED, AND ALL OTHER ORDINANCES
AND PARTS OF ORDINANCES IN CONFLICT THEREWITH

THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF HAYWARD DOES ORDAIN AS FOLLOWS:

Section 1. Effective January 1, 2008, Ordinance No. 02-13 and all amendiments _
thereto, is hereby repealed and in substitution thereof a new fire code for the City of Hayward
is hereby enacted to read as follows:

SEC. 1. FIRE PREVENTION CODE OF THE CITY OF HAYWARD
ADOPTION OF CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE. It is hereby adopted by the City Council of the
City of Hayward for the purpose of prescribing regulations governing conditions hazardous to
life and property from fire or explosion, that certain code and standards known as the 2007
California Fire Code and based on the International Fire Code being particularly the 2006
edition thereof and the whole thereof (including Appendices Chapter 1, Chapter 4, B, C, D, E,
F, G, H) save and -except such portions as are hereunder deleted, modified, or amended as set
forth hereinafter, is hereby adopted as the Fire Code of the City of Hayward. A copy of each
said California Fire Code is on file in the office of the City Clerk, to which reference is
hereby made for further particulars. B

. Said code is adopted by reference pursuant to section 50022.2 et seq. of the.
Government Code of the State of California, and the same is hereby adopted and incorporated
as fully as if set out at length herein and, from the date on which this ordinance shall take
effect, the provisions thereof shall be controlling within the limits of the City of Hayward
except as otherwise noted herein.

SEC. 2. ESTABLISHUMENT AND DUTIES OF. THE FIRE PREVENTION
OFFICE.

2.1 The California Fire Code shall be enforced by the Fire Prevention Bureau and
the Operations Division in the Fire Department of the City of Hayward.



2.2

2.3

3.1

3.2

- 3.3

The chief officer in charge of the Fire Prevention Bureau shall be appointed by
the Fire Chief.

The Chief of the Fire Department shall recommend to the City Manager the
employment of technical personnel responsible for code enforcement. The
Chief of the Fire Department may also detail such members of the Fire
Department as inspectors as shall from time to time be necessary.

SEC. 3. DEFINITIONS.

Whenever the word "jurisdiction” is used in the California Fire Code it shall be
held to mean the City of Hayward.

Whenever the term "Corporation Counsel” is used in the California Fire Code,
it shall be held to mean the City Attorney of the City of Hayward.

Whenever the term "Fire Code Official" or “Fire Marshal” is used, it shall be
held to mean the Chief Officer in charge of the Fire Prevention Bureau for the
fire department or his or her designated representative.

SEC. 4. ESTABLISHMENT OF LIMITS OF DISTRICTS IN WHICH

STORAGE OF FLAMMABLE OR COMBUSTIBLE LIQUIDS IN ABOVEGROUND
TANKS IS TO BE PROHIBITED.

4.1

4.2

The limits referred to in sections 3404.2.7.3.5.1, 3404.2.9.4, and 3404.2.9.5.1
of the California Fire Code in which storage of flammable or combustible
liquids in aboveground tanks is prohibited, are hereby established as follows:
Within the city limits of Hayward unless approved by the Fire Chief upon a
finding that such an approval ‘would not pose a danger to the health, safety, and
welfare of the population of Hayward or to neighboring properties.

The limits referred to in which new bulk plants for flammable or combustible
liquids are prohibited, are hereby established as follows: Within the city limits
of Hayward unless approved by the Fire Chief upon a finding that such an
approval would not pose a danger to the health, safety, and welfare of the
population of Hayward or to neighboring properties. '

SEC. 5. ESTABLISHMENT OF LIMITS IN WHICH BULK STORAGE OF

LIQUEFIED PETROLEUM GASES IS TO BE RESTRICTED. The limits referred to in

section 3804.2 of the California Fire Code, in which bulk storage of liquefied petroleum gas is
restricted, are hereby established as follows: Within the city limits of Hayward unless
approved by the Fire Chief upon a finding that such an approval would not pose a danger to
the health, safety and welfare of the population of Hayward or to neighboring properties.

Page 2 of Ordinance No. 07-



SEC. 6. ESTABLISHMENT OF LIMITS QF DISTRICTS IN WHICH

. STORAGE OF EXPLOSIVES AND BLASTING AGENTS IS TO BE PROHIBITED. The
limits referred to in section 3301.3 of the California Fire Code, in which storage of explosives
and blasting agents is prohibited, are hereby established as follows: Within the city limits of
Hayward unless approved by the Fire Chief upon a finding that such an approval would not
pose a danger to the health, safety, and welfare of the population of Hayward or to
neighboring properties.

SEC. 7. ESTABLISHMENT OF LIMITS OF DISTRICTS IN WHICH THE
STORAGE OF COMPRESSED NATURAL GAS IS TO BE PROHIBITED. The limits
referred to in section 3003.1 of the California Fire Code, in which storage of compressed
natural gas is prohibited, are hereby established as follows: Within the city limits of Hayward
unless approved by the Fire Chief upon a finding that such an approval would not pose a
danger to the health, safety, and welfare of the population of Hayward or to neighboring
properties,

SEC. 8. AMENDMENTS MADE IN THE CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE. The
California Fire Code is amended in the following respects, with the reference numbers being
taken from the California Fire Code, including deletions, additions and text changes.

GENERAL
APPENDIX CHAPTER 1 - ADMINISTRATION

SECTION 104 GENERAL AUTHORITY AND RESPONSIBILITIES.
104.1. Page 494-495. Amend section to read:

104.1. INVESTIGATIONS. The Fire Department shall investigate promptly
the cause, origin, and circumstances of each and every fire occurring in the jurisdiction
involving loss of life or injury to person or destruction or damage to property and, if it
appears that such fire is of suspicious origin, the department shall then initiate efforts for the
immediate collection of all physical evidence relating to the cause of the fire.

The Fire Chief is authorized to investigate the cause, origin, and circumstances
of unauthorized releases of hazardous materials. .

104.10.1 ASSISTANCE FROM OTHER AGENCY'. Page 495. Amend
subsection to read:

104.10.1 ASSISTANCE FROM OTHER AGENCY. The Police Department
shall assist the Fire Department in its investigations whenever requested to do so, unless
otherwise directed by the Chief of Police. '

Page 3 of Ordinance No. 07-



SECTION 105 PERMITS.

105.2.2 Pages 495-502 Amend section to read:

105.2.2 INSPECTION REQUIRED. Before a permit is issued, the Fire Chief
or his or her designated representative is authorized to inspect and approve the receptacles,
vehicles, buildings, devices, premises, storage spaces, or areas to be used. In instances where
laws or regulations are enforceable by departments other than the Fire Department, joint
approval shall be obtained from all departments concerned. :

Page 1-10 Add subsection 105.8 to read:

105.8 PERMIT FEES. The City Council of the City of Hayward may, if it so
desires establish by resolution, permit fees in connection with any permit required or
authorized to be issued by the Fire Chief or any other authorized representative of the fire
department.

SECTION 108 BOARD OF APPEALS.

108.1. Page 502-503. Amend section to read:

108.1. FIRE APPEALS BOARD ORGANIZATION. In order to determine
the.suitability of alternate materials and type of construction, there shall be and hereby is
created an appropriate board consisting of five members who are qualified by experience and
training to pass judgment upon pertinent matters. The Fire Chief shall be an ex officio
member and shall act as secretary of the board. The Fire Appeal Board shall be appointed by
the City Manager and shall hold office at his or her pleasure. The Board shall adopt
reasonable rules and regulations for conducting its investigations and shall render all decisions
and findings in writing to the Fire Chief, with a duplicate copy to the appellant, and may
recommend to the executive body such new legislation as is consistent therewith.

CHAPTER 2 - DEFINITIONS
SECTION 202 — GENERAIL DEFINITIONS .
High Rise Building, Page 18, add mumber 4 to read:
4. The Chief may determine that a building is a “High-rise structure” based on
site/building configuration and the lack of viable exterior access to the upper floors for
firefighting, rescue operations and where firefighters must place almost comptete reliance on

the building’s life safety features, fire protection systems and components of building
construction. '

Page 4 of Ordinance No. 07-



CHAPTER 5 - FIRE SERVICE FEATURES

SECTION 503 - FIRE APPARATUS ACCESS ROADS.

: 503.1.1 BUILDINGS AND FACILITIES. Page 51 Add new subsection
: 503 2.8 to read:

503.2.8 FIRE LANES. Where necessary to maintain adequate emergency
vehicle approaches to bulldmgs or fire apparatus access roads, the Fire Chief may establish
demgnated "Fire Lanes."

1. Restrictions and requirements as specified in the California Yehicle Code
sections 22500.1 and 22658 shall apply to fire lanes established by this section.

2. Minimwin clearances or widths shall be the same as those required for fire
apparatus access roads.

3. "I‘urning radius shall be the same as provided for in section 503.2.4
SECTION 508 - FIRE PROTECTION. WATER SUPPLIES .
208.5 FIRE HYDRANT SYSTEMS.
508.5.1 WHERE REQUIRED. Page 53. Aménd subsection to read:

508.5.1 WHERE REQUIRED. Fire hydrant systems and fire hydrants shali be
in accordance with section 508.5 Hydrants shall be of the City of Hayward approved type and
. have not less than a six-inch connection with the mains. A shutoff valve shall be installed in
. the hydrant connection a minimum distance of five feet from the hydrant. The number, size,
and arrangements of outlets, the size of the main valve opening, and the size of barrel shall be
suitable for the protection to be provided and shall be approved by the Fire Chief. Hydrants
should be tested annually for proper functioning in accordance with the requirements of the
authority having jurisdiction or upon request of the Fire Chief.

Hydrants shall be placed at least 50 feet from the buildings to be protected. Where it is
not feasible to place them at that distance they may be in closer proximity in locations
approved by the Chief. '

CHAPTER 6 -BUILDING SERVICES AND SYSTEMS
SECTION 603 ~ Fuel Fired Appliances .
603.4 - Portable Unvented Heaters. Page 58. Amend Section to read:

Page 5 of Ordinance No. 07-



| 603.4. PORTABILE UNVENTED HEATERS. The use of listed portable
unvented oil-burning heating appliances shail be limited to supplemental heating in Group U-1

Occupancies. .
EXCEPTION: When approved by the Fire Chief, portable unvented

oil-burning heating appliances may be used in any occupancy during construction when such
use is. necessary for the construction and the use does not represent a hazard to life or

property.
CHAPTER 9 - FIRE PROTECTION SYSTEMS

SECTION 901 - GENERAL.

901.4 INSTALIATION. Page 87. Amend 901.4.2 to read:
901.4.2 Non-required fire protection systems. Any fire protect1on system not
rcqu1red by this code or the California Building Code shall be installed provided that such

system meets the requirements of this code.

Add new subsection 901.4.5 to read:

901.4.5 FIRE SPRINKI.ER CONTRACTORS. All design and on-site
installation work for automatic sprinkler systems shall be done by people whose qualifications
‘satisfy applicable State of California requirements and whose expertise in the field is
demonstrable through documentation of their appropriate education, experience, or license to -
the Chief's satisfaction.

903.1 GENERAL.

903.1.1 REQUIRED INSTALLATIONS. Page 91. Add subsection to read:
An automatic sprinkler system shall be instailed in the occupancies and locations as set forth in
section 903.1.

For provisions on special hazards, hazardous materials and hazardous fire areas,
see section 305, Articles 23, 27 thru 44 and 47.

Add new subsections 903.1.2, 903.1.3, 903.1.4 and 903.1.5. to read:

903.1.2 NEW CONSTRUCTION. An automatic sprinkler system shall be
installed in all new construction, regardless of occupancy classification, where the total floor
area is 5,000 square feet (465 m?) or more (area separation walls may not be used in lieu of a
sprinkler system except when buildings are separated by continuous area separation walls of at
least four-hour fire-resistive construction without openings), building height exceeds two

Page 6 of Ordinance No. 07-



